
----- Forwarded Message ----- 

From: Terry Scarrott <terryatno6@yahoo.co.uk> 

To: Richard Brown <richard.brown1645@yahoo.co.uk>  

Sent: Thursday, 18 July 2013, 19:44 

Subject: Re: Leipzig - euro insurance 

 

Evening dearie, 

  

On page two of the attached it says we have £5,000,000.00 Liability for the European 

Union, that is applicable in the courst of the United Kingdom. 

  

So yes mate, we are covered for the EU as well as the UK. 

  

Regards 

Terry 

From: Richard Brown <richard.brown1645@yahoo.co.uk> 

To: Terry Scarrott <terryatno6@yahoo.co.uk>  

Sent: Thursday, 18 July 2013, 17:44 

Subject: Re: Leipzig - euro insurance 

 

Evening Tel 

 

Would you mind awfully having a squiz in the insurance terms and seeing if our cover is for Europe 

too (or forward it to me if electronic - save yourself the arsing about). 

 

Cheers geez 

Rich 

 


